
--NOTICES--
January 25, 2015

TODAY’S HOLY MASSES are offered for these intentions:
     9:00 AM  For Patricia O’Grady Kuhrt + (req. by Family)
   11:15 AM  For Eleanor Bergeman, Aunt + (req. by Jim Holden)

ON THE SCHEDULING OF MASSES A new system is in place
for the requesting and scheduling of intentions for both of our 
Masses.  Call 585-484-1810 or email to lmcommunity3@gmail.com 
and leave a message including:  name of person(s) for whom Mass 
will be offered, is person living or deceased?, preferred date and 
time of Mass (9 or 11:15 AM?), and a phone number to reach you. 
There are quite a few openings available for Mass Intentions. 
Please contact us soon. Note: The stipend check should be made 
payable to SAINT KATERI PARISH.

II SUNDAY ORDINARY TIME / II SUNDAY after EPIPHANY
January 18, 2015

     
9:00 AM        Attendance:  240 Offerings:  $ 1,889.10
   11:15 AM      Attendance:  165 Offerings:  $ 1,469.30
       TOTAL           405            $3,358.40

THANK YOU for your generosity.  God is blessing us through 
you!

AN ASTUTE OBSERVER has pointed out that there was a 
glaring error in last week’s bulletin!  The amounts of the TOTAL 
and AVERAGE OFFERINGS for the seven Sundays from 
11/30/14 to 1/11/15 were wrong.  The correct TOTAL amount of 
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money taken in on those Sundays was $31,330.29 and therefore the
correct AVERAGE amount would be $4475.75.  These figures are 
significantly higher than those mistakenly reported last Sunday in 
the bulletin Notices. (All I can say is—I blame my inexpensive 
calculator!  Father B.)

HOW TO CONTRIBUTE  Since our new Community here at St.
Thomas’ will not be a legal entity, we will need to have our 
finances run through the books of St. Kateri Parish.  Therefore, 
checks should be made payable to “St. Kateri Tekakwitha-Latin 
Mass Community” OR for short, “SKT-LMC”.  Contributions can 
be placed in the blue envelopes OR loose in the collection baskets.
Contributions deposited in envelopes from neighboring parishes 
will be returned to those home parishes and will not be credited  to 
SKT-LMC.

CHOIR APPEAL:  We are looking to expand the number of our 
choir (and schola) singers at our Masses.  Are you a relatively good
singer? Would you  be ready to commit to the necessary rehearsal 
times? Our musical emphasis will be on Gregorian Chant 
(sometimes in English) and Classic Polyphony.  Weekly rehearsals
are on Thursday evenings (usually) here in the church.  Until our 
choir numbers are strong enough to have separate choirs at each 
Mass, it is expected that singers may be called upon to sing at both 
Masses. Our musical program is an essential part of our 
worshipping life here; it needs to be of high quality. Contact John 
Morabito at john.a.morabito@gmail.com  or at 724-777-4701.

THANK YOU to all who worked to make last Sunday’s Coffee 
Hours such great successes! Special mention needs to be made of 
Mary Jo Maurer, Betsy Ripton, and Miriam Gorre.
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YOUR PRAYERS, PLEASE, for Father Gerard McMahon, 
who has been hospitalized at Rochester General.  For several years 
he was one of our Latin Mass priest-celebrants at St. Stanislaus 
Church.

END-of-YEAR CONTRIBUTIONS STATEMENTS from St. 
Stanislaus Parish will be available to all those who donated to the 
LMC through the St.Stanislaus census in the year 2014 (from 
January 1 through November 29).  To secure a statement, you need
to call the Parish Office at 467-3068.  Statement will be mailed.

END-of-YEAR CONTRIBUTIONS STATEMENTS from 
St.Kateri Parish will be mailed out to all those who donated to the
SKT-LMC during the last few weeks of 2014 (from November 30 
to December 31).  No phone call is necessary.

FIRST HOLY COMMUNION this year will be on SUNDAY, 
MAY 3 at both Masses.  Parents will prepare the children (7 years 
old or older) for FIRST CONFESSION and COMMUNION.  
FIRST CONFESSION MUST TAKE PLACE BEFORE 
COMMUNION.  BAPTISMAL RECORDS must be produced in 
advance.  There will be a MANDATORY rehearsal on Sunday, 
April 26 and a definite dress code.  INTERESTED FAMILIES:  
PLEASE MEET WITH FATHER BONSIGNORE TODAY 
IMMEDIATELY AFTER MASS IN THE CHURCH.


